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FOI 4070 

Transthyretin Amyloidosis (ATTR) 

1) How many new patients have been diagnosed with wild type Transthyretin 

Amyloid Cardiomyopathy (ATTR-CM) in your Trust in the last 4 months? 

 

The Northern Trust do not keep a database of ATTR amyloid patients. 

 

The number of patients who attended the hospital as an inpatient with a code for 

ATTR-CM anywhere in their 25 diagnosis code positions, between 01/01/2026 - 

30/04/2026, was 6 patients.  

 

2) How many new patients have been diagnosed with hereditary Transthyretin 

Amyloid Polyneuropathy (ATTR-PN) in your Trust in the last 4 months? 

 

The Northern Trust do not keep a database of ATTR amyloid patients. 

 

No patients were found with ATTR-PN. 

 

3) What is the total number of patients with wild type Transthyretin Amyloid 

Cardiomyopathy (ATTR-CM) being treated in your Trust? 

 

The Northern Trust do not keep a database of ATTR amyloid patients. 

 

4) What is the total number of patients with hereditary Transthyretin Amyloid 

Polyneuropathy (ATTR-PN) being treated in your Trust? 

 

The Northern Trust do not keep a database of ATTR amyloid patients. 

 

 

5) Of the newly diagnosed wild type ATTR-CM patients, how many were initiated 

with the following treatments: 

 

a) Vutrisiran- 0 

b) Tafamidis 61mg- Jan 2026 – Apr 2026 - 1 

c) Acoramidis- 0 

d) Enrolled in a clinical study- no drug clinical trials.  

 

 

6) Of the newly diagnosed ATTR-PN patients, how many were initiated with the 

following treatments:  

a) Vutrisiran- 0 

b) Eplontersen- 0  

c) Enrolled in a clinical study- no drug clinical trials. 

 

mailto:info.governance@northerntrust.hscni.net


  
 
 

 

Email: info.governance@northerntrust.hscni.net  P a g e  2 | 2 

 

 

7) What is your Trust's protocol for confirming diagnosis of ATTR patients? Is 

diagnosis confirmed by your Trust or the National Amyloidosis Centre (NAC)? 

 

Diagnosis in some cases is made by local cardiologist following a combination of 

imaging and histological investigation. In other cases, patients are referred to the 

National amyloidosis centre for definitive diagnosis.   

 

 

8) Of the diagnosed patients, how many had their diagnosis made/confirmed  

in your Trust by the National Amyloidosis Centre (NAC) London or Midlands? 

 

Information not held.  

 

9) How many patients have been confirmed for treatment initiation either:   

a) Virtually  

b) In person  

 

Information not held.  
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