
Freedom of Information Request  

1.) How many unvaccinated people have been admitted to Northern Health 
and Social Care Trust Hospitals / Intensive care since the vaccination 
programme first commenced? 

This information is not recorded by the Trust. 

2.) How many vaccinated (1 or 2 doses cumulative) people have been 
admitted to Northern Health and Social Care Trust Hospitals / Intensive 
care since the vaccination programme first commenced? 

This information is not recorded by the Trust. 

3.) What percentage of people have fully recovered from Covid-19 
(Coronavirus, Covid, Sars-cov-2) after being admitted to Northern 
Health and Social Care Trust Hospitals / Intensive care – March 2020-
July 2021? 

This information is not recorded by the Trust. 

4.) What percentage of reported covid cases in your area have been mild 
or had no symptoms at all (asymptomatic). Not including being 
hospitalised – March 2020-July 2021? 

This information is not recorded by the Trust. 

5.)    What is the overall total number of people who have died in the 
Northern Health and Social Care Trust by covid-19 ONLY with no co-
morbidities / any other health issues? 

Total of 7 people. 

6.)    Lastly, what is the average age of all deaths of people who have died 
in Northern Health and Social Care Trust from covid-19 ONLY with no 
co-morbidities / any other health issues? 

Average age is 68. 


