

## **Freedom of Information Request**

- 1. the number of people since March 2020 to current who have been hospitalised as a result of possible covid vaccine reaction.**

10 patients have been admitted to an NHSCT hospital with a diagnosis of possible COVID vaccine reaction. The average length of stay in hospital of these patients was 1.6 days.

- 2. the number of people currently in hospital with covid who are vaccinated and the number who aren't.**

The Trust does not hold a list of inpatients who have had their Covid-19 vaccinations. Some patients may have their vaccination status recorded within their casenote as part of their medical history, however it is not held centrally in a readily available format.

- 3. current number of pregnant women hospitalised who are vaccinated and the number who aren't.**

The Trust does not hold a list of inpatients who have had their Covid-19 vaccinations. Some patients may have their vaccination status recorded within their casenote as part of their medical history, however it is not held centrally in a readily available format.