

Freedom of Information Request

- 1. How many pregnant women have been admitted to hospital for treatment for Covid-19?**

49 pregnant women have been admitted to hospital for treatment for Covid-19 for the period 01/01/2021 – 31/08/2021.

- 2. How many of them have been regarded as seriously ill?**

The Trust's information system do not classify patients and therefore we do not have a code for "seriously ill".

- 3. How many of them have been admitted to ICU for treatment of Covid-19?**

The Northern Health and Social Care Trust ("the Trust") cannot provide this information due to the small numbers involved i.e. less than 10, as this could be potentially matched up with other information to allow individuals to be identified. The Trust therefore considers this information exempt under Section 40(2)(3) of the Freedom of Information Act.

- 4. How many of them have needed a ventilator?**

This information is not recorded on a Trust information system.

- 5. For the above what is the ratio of vaccinated vs unvaccinated?**

The Trust does not hold a list of inpatients who have had their Covid-19 vaccinations. Some patients may have their vaccination status recorded within their casenote as part of their medical history, however it is not held centrally in a readily available format.