

Freedom of Information Request Reference

1. The total amount paid in WLI payments to staff in 2019/20?

£491,125 paid to medical staff for WLI sessions.

The Trust does not record the amount paid to Nurses for WLI sessions.

2. The total number of WLI sessions in 2019/20?

877

3. The total amount paid in overtime to staff in 2019/20?

Total £000's	Medical £000's	Nursing £000's	Other £000's
11,002	0	1,363	9,639

4. The total number of overtime hours in 2019/20?

The Trust does not hold a record of the number of overtime hours paid to staff in 2019/20.

5. Please provide the minimum and maximum sessional rate for WLI payments during 2019/20 for medical staff?

Sessional rate paid to medical staff for WLI payments

- Theatre Session = £750
- OP (Consultant) = £500
- OP (Specialty Dr) = £375