

Freedom of Information Request Reference

1. How many patients of the Northern Trust were treated for blood clots since December 2020 to present.

1. How many patients of the Northern Trust were treated for blood clots since December 2020 to present (31/07/2021).

Year	Month	No. of Patients
Y2020	December	47
Y2021	January	82
Y2021	February	52
Y2021	March	44
Y2021	April	39
Y2021	May	42
Y2021	June	42
Y2021	July	38
Total		386

2. Of those treated for blood clots, how many received their first OR second covid vaccine?

This information is not recorded by the Trust.

3. How many vaccine related deaths have been recorded by the trust from the vaccine roll out in December 2020?

None.

4. How many patients were admitted to hospital with COVID-19 from April 2021 to present.

4. How many patients were admitted to hospital with COVID-19 from April 2021 to present (31/07/2021).

Year	Month	Admissions
Y2021	April	74
Y2021	May	36
Y2021	June	18
Y2021	July	160
Total		1875

5. Of those patients, how many had received both vaccines?

This information is not recorded by the Trust.