

Freedom of Information Request –

Please supply the following information for each quarter of each calendar year since 2016 up to and including the current year.

Please supply the information both as a) number of cases and b) percentage of total number of births.

1. Miscarriages

Miscarriages (O03.0 - O03.9 and O02.1) By Quarter By Calendar Year from 2016 to 31/12/2021

Year	Quarter	Sum of Admissions	Sum of Day Cases
Y2016	Q1	55	25
	Q2	53	33
	Q3	42	35
	Q4	56	28
Y2017	Q1	42	35
	Q2	44	36
	Q3	33	22
	Q4	36	32
Y2018	Q1	56	29
	Q2	53	31
	Q3	56	32
	Q4	32	37
Y2019	Q1	58	38
	Q2	40	37
	Q3	33	34
	Q4	50	36
Y2020	Q1	53	28
	Q2	46	19
	Q3	48	23
	Q4	29	29
Y2021	Q1	58	30
	Q2	49	26
	Q3	62	6
	Q4	64	4
Grand Total		1148	685

Source - PAS admissions and discharges current and historical
Dept - Information & Records Acute

2. Ectopic pregnancies

Patients Admitted
with Ectopic
Pregnancy
(01/01/2016 to
31/12/2021)

Year	Quarter	Antrim Hospital	Causeway Hospital	Total
Y2016	Q1	13	3	16
	Q2	6	2	8
	Q3	4	0	4
	Q4	8	3	11
Y2017	Q1	8	5	13
	Q2	7	2	9
	Q3	6	1	7
	Q4	6	2	8
Y2018	Q1	4	2	6
	Q2	5	2	7
	Q3	8	1	9
	Q4	7	3	10
Y2019	Q1	5	2	7
	Q2	7	3	10
	Q3	6	2	8
	Q4	8	2	10
Y2020	Q1	10	0	10
	Q2	11	2	13
	Q3	10	2	12
	Q4	5	3	8
Y2021	Q1	11	0	11
	Q2	12	4	16
	Q3	11	5	16
	Q4	13	4	17
Total		191	55	246

Source - PAS admissions and discharges current and historical
Dept - Information & Records Acute

3. Still births

Still Births per quarter 01/01/2016 - 31/12/2021

3. Still births

Year/ Quarter	Total Cases (a)	Total Births	% of Total Births (b)
2016 Q1	6	933	0.64
2016 Q2	5	1001	0.50
2016 Q3	7	1090	0.64
2016 Q4	3	1019	0.29
2017 Q1	6	943	0.64
2017 Q2	6	933	0.64
2017 Q3	2	1054	0.19
2017 Q4	2	987	0.20
2018 Q1	2	874	0.23
2018 Q2	4	944	0.42
2018 Q3	3	1004	0.30
2018 Q4	1	951	0.11
2019 Q1	4	910	0.44
2019 Q2	3	956	0.31
2019 Q3	1	1016	0.10
2019 Q4	5	983	0.51
2020 Q1	0	912	0.00
2020 Q2	3	932	0.32
2020 Q3	3	1000	0.30
2020 Q4	2	929	0.22
2021 Q1	2	924	0.22
2021 Q2	3	911	0.33
2021 Q3	7	1030	0.68
2021 Q4	4	990	0.40

4. Babies born with fatal or life-limiting health problems

This information is not recorded on the Trust Information system; therefore, the Trust is unable to provide this.

5. Premature births

Premature Births by 01/01/2016 - 31/12/2021

Year/ Quarter	Premature Births (a)	Total births	% of Total Births (b)
2016 Q1	78	933	8.36
2016 Q2	67	1001	6.69
2016 Q3	78	1090	7.16
2016 Q4	65	1019	6.38
2017 Q1	68	943	7.21
2017 Q2	66	933	7.07
2017 Q3	68	1054	6.45
2017 Q4	62	987	6.28
2018 Q1	62	874	7.09
2018 Q2	66	944	6.99
2018 Q3	77	1004	7.67
2018 Q4	66	951	6.94
2019 Q1	63	910	6.92
2019 Q2	58	956	6.07
2019 Q3	90	1016	8.86
2019 Q4	89	983	9.05
2020 Q1	50	912	5.48
2020 Q2	69	932	7.40
2020 Q3	54	1000	5.40
2020 Q4	43	929	4.63
2021 Q1	57	924	6.17
2021 Q2	57	911	6.26
2021 Q3	67	1030	6.50
2021 Q4	85	990	8.59

6. Infant mortality up to 1 year

Infant mortality up to 1 year from 01/1/2016 - 31/12/2021

Year	Quarter	Antrim Hospital	Causeway Hospital	Total
Y2016	Q1	6	2	8
	Q2	6	0	6
	Q3	8	3	11
	Q4	3	1	4
Y2017	Q1	3	3	6
	Q2	3	3	6
	Q3	0	3	3
	Q4	1	2	3
Y2018	Q1	3	1	4
	Q2	0	5	5
	Q3	5	0	5
	Q4	2	1	3
Y2019	Q1	5	0	5
	Q2	2	1	3
	Q3	3	0	3
	Q4	6	1	7
Y2020	Q1	0	0	0
	Q2	4	0	4
	Q3	2	2	4
	Q4	1	1	2
Y2021	Q1	4	1	5
	Q2	7	2	9
	Q3	6	1	7
	Q4	6	0	6
Total		86	33	119

source - Admissions and discharges current and historical
Dept of Information and Records - acute information

7. Maternal mortality

This information is not recorded on the Trust Information system; therefore, the Trust is unable to provide this.

8. Maternal morbidity

This information is not recorded on the Trust Information system; therefore, the Trust is unable to provide this.